
SPECIAL SESSION

FIRST DAY

St. Paul, Minnesota, Monday, June 11, 2001

The Senate met at 8:00 a.m. and was called to order by the President.

CALL OF THE SENATE

Senator Moe, R.D. imposed a call of the Senate. The Sergeant at Arms was instructed to bring
in the absent members.

Prayer was offered by the Chaplain, Rev. Roger D. Ezell.

The members of the Senate gave the pledge of allegiance to the flag of the United States of
America.

The Secretary called the roll by legislative districts in numerical order as follows:

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . First District LeRoy A. Stumpf
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Second District Roger D. Moe

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Third District Bob Lessard
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fourth District Anthony G. Kinkel

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fifth District David J. Tomassoni
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Sixth District Douglas J. Johnson

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Seventh District Sam G. Solon
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Eighth District Becky Lourey

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Ninth District Keith Langseth
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Tenth District Cal Larson

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Eleventh District Dallas C. Sams
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Twelfth District Don Samuelson

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Thirteenth District Charles A. Berg
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fourteenth District Michelle L. Fischbach

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fifteenth District Dean E. Johnson
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Sixteenth District Dave Kleis

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Seventeenth District Dan Stevens
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Eighteenth District Twyla L. Ring
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Nineteenth District Mark Ourada
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Twentieth District Steve Dille

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Twenty-first District Arlene J. Lesewski
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Twenty-second District Jim Vickerman

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Twenty-third District Dennis R. Frederickson
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Twenty-fourth District John C. Hottinger

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Twenty-fifth District Thomas M. Neuville
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Twenty-sixth District Chuck Fowler

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Twenty-seventh District Grace Schwab
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 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Twenty-eighth District Dick Day
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Twenty-ninth District Steve Murphy

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Thirtieth District Sheila M. Kiscaden
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Thirty-first District Kenric J. Scheevel

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Thirty-second District Bob Kierlin
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Thirty-third District Warren Limmer

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Thirty-fourth District Gen Olson
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Thirty-fifth District Claire A. Robling
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Thirty-sixth District David L. Knutson

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Thirty-seventh District Pat Pariseau
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Thirty-eighth District Deanna L. Wiener

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Thirty-ninth District James P. Metzen
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fortieth District Dave H. Johnson

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Forty-first District William V. Belanger, Jr.
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Forty-second District Roy Terwilliger

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Forty-third District Edward C. Oliver
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Forty-fourth District Steve P. Kelley

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Forty-fifth District Martha R. Robertson
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Forty-sixth District Ann H. Rest

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Forty-seventh District Linda Scheid
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Forty-eighth District Don Betzold
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Forty-ninth District Leo T. Foley

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fiftieth District Debbie J. Johnson
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fifty-first District Jane Krentz

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fifty-second District Satveer Chaudhary
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fifty-third District Mady (Madelyn) E. Reiter

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fifty-fourth District John Marty
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fifty-fifth District Charles W. Wiger
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fifty-sixth District Michele M. Bachmann

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fifty-seventh District Leonard R. Price
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fifty-eighth District Linda Higgins

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Fifty-ninth District Lawrence J. Pogemiller
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Sixtieth District Myron Orfield

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Sixty-first District Linda Berglin
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Sixty-second District Julie A. Sabo

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Sixty-third District Jane B. Ranum
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Sixty-fourth District Richard J. Cohen

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Sixty-fifth District Sandra L. Pappas
 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Sixty-sixth District Ellen R. Anderson

 .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  .  . Sixty-seventh District Randy C. Kelly
The President declared a quorum present.

MEMBERS EXCUSED

Senators Bachmann; Berg; Johnson, Doug; Kelley, S.P.; Kelly, R.C.; Knutson; Lesewski;
Lessard; Scheevel and Solon were excused from the Session of today.

STATE OF MINNESOTA

PROCLAMATION

WHEREAS: The Eighty-Second Legislature adjourned without enacting essential legislation to
provide for the orderly financial management of state government creating a threat to the health,
well-being and safety of the citizens of Minnesota; and
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WHEREAS: The time permitted by law for passage of such legislation during the 2001 session
for the Legislature has expired, and an extraordinary occasion as envisioned by Article IV, Section
12 of the Minnesota Constitution is thereby created; and

WHEREAS: The people of Minnesota are best served by avoidance of a government shutdown
and a prompt conclusion of legislative business, with a limited agenda and, to every extent
possible, prior agreement on laws to be enacted.

NOW THEREFORE, I, JESSE VENTURA, Governor of Minnesota, do hereby summon you,
members of the Legislature, to convene in Special Session of Monday, June 11, 2001, at 8:00 a.m.
at the State Capitol in Saint Paul, Minnesota.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and caused the Great Seal of the State
of Minnesota to be affixed at the State Capitol this 7th day of June in the year two thousand and
one, and of the State the one hundred forty-third.

Jesse Ventura
GOVERNOR

Mary Kiffmeyer
SECRETARY OF STATE

MOTIONS AND RESOLUTIONS

Senators Moe, R.D. and Day introduced--

Senate Resolution No. 1: A Senate resolution relating to organization and operation of the
Senate during the Special Session.

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Senate of the State of Minnesota:

The Senate is organized under Minnesota Statutes, sections 3.073 and 3.103.

The Rules of the Senate for the 82nd Legislature are the Rules for the Special Session, except
that Rules 3.5, 5, and 9 are not operative other than as provided in this resolution.

The Committee on Rules and Administration is established in the same manner and with the
same powers as in the 82nd Legislature.

With respect to Rule 30, Reconsideration, a notice of intention to move for reconsideration is
not in order, but a motion to reconsider may be made, and when made has priority over other
business except a motion to adjourn.

Senator Kleis moved to amend Senate Resolution No. 1 as follows:

Page 1, line 9, delete "and" and after "9" insert ", and 35.3"

The motion did not prevail. So the amendment was not adopted.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved the adoption of the foregoing resolution.

The question was taken on the adoption of the resolution.

The roll was called, and there were yeas 54 and nays 0, as follows:

Those who voted in the affirmative were:
Anderson Betzold Day Fowler Hottinger
Belanger Chaudhary Fischbach Frederickson Johnson, Dave
Berglin Cohen Foley Higgins Johnson, Dean
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Johnson, Debbie Limmer Olson Reiter Schwab
Kierlin Lourey Orfield Ring Stevens
Kinkel Marty Ourada Robertson Terwilliger
Kiscaden Metzen Pappas Robling Tomassoni
Kleis Moe, R.D. Pariseau Sabo Vickerman
Krentz Murphy Pogemiller Sams Wiener
Langseth Neuville Price Samuelson Wiger
Larson Oliver Ranum Scheid

The motion prevailed. So the resolution was adopted.

MOTIONS AND RESOLUTIONS - CONTINUED

Senators Moe, R.D. and Day introduced--

Senate Resolution No. 2: A Senate resolution relating to notifying the House of
Representatives and the Governor that the Senate is organized.

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Senate of the State of Minnesota:

The Secretary of the Senate shall notify the House of Representatives and the Governor that the
Senate is now duly organized under the Minnesota Constitution and Minnesota Statutes.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved the adoption of the foregoing resolution. The motion prevailed. So
the resolution was adopted.

Without objection, remaining on the Order of Business of Motions and Resolutions, the Senate
reverted to the Order of Business of Messages From the House.

MESSAGES FROM THE HOUSE

Mr. President:

I have the honor to inform you that the House of Representatives of the State of Minnesota is
now duly organized for the 2001 Special Session pursuant to law.

Edward A. Burdick, Chief Clerk, House of Representatives

Transmitted June 11, 2001

MOTIONS AND RESOLUTIONS - CONTINUED

Without objection, remaining on the Order of Business of Motions and Resolutions, the Senate
proceeded to the Order of Business of Introduction and First Reading of Senate Bills.

INTRODUCTION AND FIRST READING OF SENATE BILLS

The following bills were read the first time and referred to the committees indicated.

Senator Hottinger introduced--

S.F. No. 1: A bill for an act relating to health; establishing minimum staffing standards for
nursing facilities; requiring facilities to post information on staffing standards; requiring studies;
appropriating money; proposing coding for new law in Minnesota Statutes, chapter 144A.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 1 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.
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Senator Johnson, Dave introduced--

S.F. No. 2: A bill for an act relating to a new sports stadium; creating a task force to study
stadiums; mandating issues to be studied; imposing a deadline; inviting proposals; requiring a
report.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 2 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

Senator Kleis introduced--

S.F. No. 3: A bill for an act proposing an amendment to the Minnesota Constitution to provide
for a unicameral legislature with staggered terms; changing article IV; article V, sections 3 and 5;
article VIII, section 1; article IX, sections 1 and 2; and article XI, section 5; providing by law for a
unicameral legislature of 134 members; amending Minnesota Statutes 2000, sections 2.021; and
2.031, subdivision 1.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 3 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

Senator Berglin introduced--

S.F. No. 4: A bill for an act relating to the operation of state government; modifying provisions
relating to health; health department; health care; human services; human services department;
continuing care; consumer information; long-term care system reform and reimbursement;
workforce recruitment and retention; nursing services; agencies; long-term care insurance;
assistance programs; child welfare and child support; licensing; vital statistics; appropriating
money for health and human services and criminal justice; amending Minnesota Statutes 2000,
sections 13.46, subdivision 4; 13B.06, subdivision 7; 62A.48, subdivision 4, by adding
subdivisions; 62J.152, subdivision 8; 62J.451, subdivision 5; 62S.01, by adding subdivisions;
62S.26; 103I.101, subdivision 6; 103I.112; 103I.208, subdivisions 1, 2; 103I.235, subdivision 1;
103I.525, subdivisions 2, 6, 8, 9; 103I.531, subdivisions 2, 6, 8, 9; 103I.535, subdivisions 2, 6, 8,
9; 103I.541, subdivisions 2b, 4, 5; 103I.545; 116L.11, subdivision 4; 116L.12, subdivisions 4, 5;
116L.13, subdivision 1; 144.057; 144.0721, subdivision 1; 144.1202, subdivision 4; 144.1491,
subdivision 1; 144.212, subdivisions 2a, 3, 5, 7, 8, 9, 11; 144.214, subdivisions 1, 3, 4; 144.215,
subdivisions 1, 3, 4, 6, 7; 144.217; 144.218; 144.221, subdivisions 1, 3; 144.222, subdivision 2;
144.223; 144.225, subdivisions 1, 2, 2a, 3, 7, as amended; 144.226, subdivisions 1, 3, 4; 144.227;
144.551, subdivision 1; 144.98, subdivision 3; 144A.071, subdivisions 1, 1a, 2; 144A.073,
subdivision 4; 144A.44, subdivision 1; 144A.4605, subdivision 4; 144D.03, subdivision 2;
144D.04, subdivisions 2, 3; 144D.06; 145.881, subdivision 2; 145.882, by adding a subdivision;
145.885, subdivision 2; 148.212; 148.284; 148B.21, subdivision 6a; 148B.22, subdivision 3;
157.16, subdivision 3; 157.22, as amended; 214.104; 245.462, subdivisions 8, 18, by adding
subdivisions; 245.474, by adding a subdivision; 245.4871, subdivisions 10, 27, by adding a
subdivision; 245.4876, subdivision 1, by adding a subdivision; 245.4885, subdivision 1; 245.4886,
subdivision 1; 245.99, subdivision 4; 245A.02, subdivisions 1, 9, by adding a subdivision;
245A.03, subdivisions 2, 2b, by adding a subdivision; 245A.035, subdivision 1; 245A.04,
subdivisions 3, 3a, 3b, 3c, 3d, 6, 11, by adding a subdivision; 245A.05; 245A.06; 245A.07;
245A.08; 245A.13, subdivisions 7, 8; 245A.16, subdivision 1; 245B.08, subdivision 3; 252.275,
subdivision 4b; 252A.02, subdivisions 12, 13, by adding a subdivision; 252A.111, subdivision 6;
252A.16, subdivision 1; 252A.19, subdivision 2; 252A.20, subdivision 1; 253B.02, subdivision 10;
253B.03, subdivisions 5, 10, by adding a subdivision; 253B.04, subdivisions 1, 1a, by adding a
subdivision; 253B.045, subdivision 6; 253B.05, subdivision 1; 253B.065, subdivision 5;
253B.066, subdivision 1; 253B.07, subdivisions 1, 2, 7; 253B.09, subdivision 1; 253B.10,
subdivision 4; 254B.09, by adding a subdivision; 256.01, subdivision 2, by adding a subdivision;
256.045, subdivisions 3, 3b, 4; 256.476, subdivisions 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 8, by adding a subdivision;
256.741, subdivisions 1, 5, 8; 256.9657, subdivision 2; 256.975, by adding a subdivision; 256.979,
subdivisions 5, 6; 256.98, subdivision 8; 256B.04, by adding a subdivision; 256B.056, subdivision
4b; 256B.0625, subdivisions 3b, 7, 13, 13a, 19a, 19c, 20, 34, by adding subdivisions; 256B.0627,
subdivisions 1, 2, 4, 5, 7, 8, 10, 11, by adding subdivisions; 256B.0911, subdivisions 1, 3, 5, 6, 7,
by adding subdivisions; 256B.0913, subdivisions 1, 2, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 13, 14; 256B.0915,
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subdivisions 1d, 3, 5; 256B.0916, subdivisions 7, 9, by adding a subdivision; 256B.0917,
subdivision 7; 256B.092, subdivision 5; 256B.093, subdivision 3; 256B.431, by adding
subdivisions; 256B.433, subdivision 3a; 256B.49, by adding subdivisions; 256B.69, subdivision
23, by adding a subdivision; 256B.75; 256D.35, by adding subdivisions; 256D.44, subdivision 5;
256J.08, subdivision 55a, by adding a subdivision; 256J.09, subdivisions 1, 2, 3, by adding
subdivisions; 256J.24, subdivisions 2, 9, 10; 256J.31, subdivision 4; 256J.39, subdivision 2;
256J.42, subdivisions 1, 3; 256J.45, subdivision 1; 256J.48, by adding a subdivision; 256J.49,
subdivisions 2, 13, by adding a subdivision; 256J.50, by adding a subdivision; 256J.57,
subdivision 2; 256J.62, subdivision 2a; 256J.645; 256L.05, subdivision 2; 256L.06, subdivision 3;
256L.12, by adding a subdivision; 257.0725; 260C.201, subdivision 1, as amended; 260C.317,
subdivision 4; 268.0122, subdivision 2; 326.38; 393.07, by adding a subdivision; 518.5513,
subdivision 5; 518.575, subdivision 1; 518.5851, by adding a subdivision; 518.5853, by adding a
subdivision; 518.6111, subdivision 5; 518.6195; 518.64, subdivision 2, as amended; 518.641,
subdivisions 1, 2, 3, by adding a subdivision; 548.091, subdivision 1a; 626.556, subdivisions 10,
as amended, 10d, as amended, 12; 626.557, subdivisions 3, 9d, 12b; 626.5572, subdivision 17;
626.559, subdivision 2; Laws 1999, chapter 152, section 1; Laws 1999, chapter 245, article 3,
section 45, as amended; Laws 1999, chapter 245, article 4, section 110; Laws 2000, chapter 364,
section 2; proposing coding for new law in Minnesota Statutes, chapters 62Q; 62S; 116L; 144;
144A; 145; 214; 245A; 256; 256B; 299A; 325F; repealing Minnesota Statutes 2000, sections
116L.12, subdivisions 2, 7; 144.148, subdivision 8; 144.1761; 144.217, subdivision 4; 144.219;
144A.16; 145.882, subdivisions 3, 4; 145.927; 252A.111, subdivision 3; 256B.0911, subdivisions
2, 2a, 4, 9; 256B.0913, subdivisions 3, 15a, 15b, 15c, 16; 256B.0915, subdivisions 3a, 3b, 3c;
256B.434, subdivision 5; 518.641, subdivisions 4, 5; Minnesota Rules, parts 4655.6810;
4655.6820; 4655.6830; 4658.1600; 4658.1605; 4658.1610; 4658.1690; 9505.2390; 9505.2395;
9505.2396; 9505.2400; 9505.2405; 9505.2410; 9505.2413; 9505.2415; 9505.2420; 9505.2425;
9505.2426; 9505.2430; 9505.2435; 9505.2440; 9505.2445; 9505.2450; 9505.2455; 9505.2458;
9505.2460; 9505.2465; 9505.2470; 9505.2473; 9505.2475; 9505.2480; 9505.2485; 9505.2486;
9505.2490; 9505.2495; 9505.2496; 9505.2500; 9543.3000; 9543.3010; 9543.3020; 9543.3030;
9543.3040; 9543.3050; 9543.3060; 9543.3080; 9543.3090; 9546.0010; 9546.0020; 9546.0030;
9546.0040; 9546.0050; 9546.0060.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 4 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

Senator Lourey introduced--

S.F. No. 5: A bill for an act relating to family and early childhood education; providing for
children and family support programs, prevention and intervention, self-sufficiency and lifelong
learning, and libraries; appropriating money; amending Minnesota Statutes 2000, sections
119A.12, by adding subdivisions; 119A.13, subdivision 4; 119A.21; 119A.22; 119B.011,
subdivision 19; 119B.06, by adding a subdivision; 119B.061, subdivision 4; 119B.13, subdivision
6; 119B.24; 124D.135, by adding subdivisions; 124D.16, subdivision 2, by adding subdivisions;
124D.19, by adding subdivisions; 124D.20, subdivisions 1, 5, by adding a subdivision; 124D.52,
subdivision 2; 124D.522; 124D.531, subdivisions 1, 3; 125A.28; 125B.20, subdivision 1; 134.31,
subdivision 5; Laws 2000, chapter 489, article 5, section 23; proposing coding for new law in
Minnesota Statutes, chapters 119A; 134; repealing Minnesota Statutes 2000, sections 119A.13,
subdivisions 1, 2, 3; 119A.14, subdivision 2; 119A.23; 124D.33; 124D.331; 125B.20, subdivision
3; Minnesota Rules, parts 3530.2610; 3530.2612; 3530.2614; 3530.2616; 3530.2618; 3530.2620;
3530.2622; 3530.2624; 3530.2626; 3530.2628; 3530.2630; 3530.2632; 3530.2634; 3530.2636;
3530.2638; 3530.2640; 3530.2642; 3530.2644.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 5 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

Senator Stumpf introduced--

S.F. No. 6: A bill for an act relating to education; providing for kindergarten through grade 12
education including general education revenue; education excellence; special programs; facilities
and technology; nutrition, school accounting, and other programs; state agencies; and technical
amendments; appropriating money; amending Minnesota Statutes 2000, sections 16B.616,
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subdivision 4; 121A.41, subdivision 10; 121A.582; 122A.18, by adding a subdivision; 122A.25,
by adding a subdivision; 122A.26, subdivision 3; 122A.31; 122A.61, subdivision 1; 123B.03,
subdivision 3; 123B.42, subdivision 3; 123B.44, subdivision 6; 123B.57, subdivisions 3, 6, 8;
123B.71, subdivisions 1, 4, 8, 9; 123B.75, subdivision 5, by adding a subdivision; 124D.03,
subdivision 4; 124D.10, subdivision 1; 124D.11, subdivision 5; 124D.454, subdivision 11;
124D.59, subdivision 2; 124D.65, subdivision 5; 124D.69, subdivision 1; 124D.74, subdivisions 2,
3, 4, 6; 124D.75, subdivision 6; 124D.76; 124D.78, subdivision 1; 124D.81, subdivisions 1, 3, 5,
6, 7; 124D.84, subdivision 1; 124D.892, subdivisions 1, 3; 125A.023, subdivision 4; 125A.08;
125A.09, subdivision 3; 125A.11, subdivision 3; 125A.17; 125A.27, subdivision 15; 125A.76,
subdivisions 1, 2; 126C.05, subdivision 1; 126C.10, subdivisions 1, 9; 126C.12, subdivisions 2, 3,
4, 5, by adding a subdivision; 126C.17, subdivisions 6, 9, 10, 11; 126C.23, subdivision 5;
126C.41, subdivision 3; 127A.41, subdivisions 5, 8, 9; 127A.45, subdivision 12, by adding a
subdivision; 127A.50, subdivision 2; 129C.10, subdivision 3; 260A.01; 260C.163, subdivision 11;
626.556, subdivision 2, as amended; Laws 2000, chapter 489, article 2, section 34; Laws 2000,
chapter 489, article 2, section 37, subdivision 3; Laws 2000, chapter 489, article 2, section 39,
subdivision 2; Laws 2000, chapter 489, article 3, section 24; Laws 2000, chapter 489, article 3,
section 25, subdivision 5; Laws 2000, chapter 489, article 5, section 21; proposing coding for new
law in Minnesota Statutes, chapters 122A; 124D; repealing Minnesota Statutes 2000, sections
123B.71, subdivisions 3, 10; 124D.1155; Laws 2000, chapter 254, section 30; Laws 2000, chapter
489, article 1, section 18; Minnesota Rules, part 3501.0280, subpart 3.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 6 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

Senator Johnson, Dean introduced--

S.F. No. 7: A bill for an act relating to the organization and operation of state government;
appropriating money for transportation, public safety, and the judicial system; requiring a study of
certain high-occupancy vehicle lanes; directing construction of a global position tower by the
commissioner of transportation; eliminating a repeal of the state-aid rules advisory committee;
providing for the disposition of proceeds from sale of state trunk highway bonds and property
purchased therewith; exempting vehicles of the gambling control board from registration;
providing for certain department of transportation contracts; designating King of Trails; providing
for payment of certain engineering costs from town bridge account; providing for revenues from
certain department of transportation leases; authorizing advance funding for interregional corridor
development; adjusting percentages of state-aid funds set aside for disaster accounts; authorizing
display of certain temporary vehicle permits; making certain changes in motor vehicle dealer
licensing law; increasing motor vehicle registration filing fee; providing for refunds of registration
tax for canceled sale; allowing electronic filing of accident reports; authorizing the commissioner
of transportation to bill for pavement marking; making certain changes in greater Minnesota
public transit assistance program; changing definition of major transportation project; restricting
certain expenditures of state funds for study of light rail transit and commuter rail; authorizing
establishment of railroad quiet zones by local governments; authorizing disposal of certain
property in state rail bank; eliminating certain accounts in transportation revolving loan fund and
expanding eligibility for loans therefrom; restricting recovery for loss arising from operation of
recreational vehicle on highway right-of-way; repealing sunset of metropolitan council
performance-based funding program for certain transit providers; establishing procedures for
racial profiling data collection and analysis; requiring retention of an outside expert to analyze
racial profiling data; requiring law enforcement training and conferences to eliminate racial
profiling; increasing surcharges on criminal and traffic offenders to fund racial profiling and other
criminal justice initiatives; creating a felony driving while impaired penalty for repeat offenders;
establishing mandatory penalties for repeat driving while impaired offenders; modifying,
clarifying, and expanding laws related to driving while impaired offenses; providing criminal
penalties; increasing fines and surcharges; designating responsibility for obtaining identification
data from persons arrested or appearing in court on charges; requiring reports on suspense file
information; changing the membership of the criminal justice information policy group; specifying
procedures for setting the salaries of retired judges acting as a justice or judge; clarifying,
expanding, and modifying laws related to predatory offender registration; expanding the group of
offenders who must provide a biological specimen for DNA testing; expanding, modifying, and
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proscribing the penalties for abuse of a service animal, pet, or companion animal; modifying and
establishing procedures for identifying and destroying dangerous animals; clarifying the penalty
for certain crimes involving fleeing a peace officer; modifying the crimes of assisting an offender;
increasing the penalty for the dissemination of child pornography; amending Minnesota Statutes
2000, sections 2.724, subdivision 3; 13.87, by adding a subdivision; 16A.641, subdivision 8;
16B.54, subdivision 2; 16C.05, subdivision 2; 161.082, subdivision 2a; 161.14, by adding a
subdivision; 161.23, subdivision 3; 161.32, subdivisions 1, 1a, 1b, 1e; 162.06, subdivision 3;
162.12, subdivision 3; 167.51, subdivision 2; 168.012, subdivision 1; 168.09, subdivision 7;
168.27, subdivisions 12a, 20; 168.33, subdivision 7; 169.09, subdivisions 8, 9; 169.67, subdivision
3; 169.79; 169A.03, subdivision 12; 169A.07; 169A.20, subdivision 3; 169A.25; 169A.26;
169A.27; 169A.275; 169A.277, subdivision 2; 169A.28, subdivision 2; 169A.283, subdivision 1;
169A.35, subdivision 1, by adding a subdivision; 169A.37, subdivision 1; 169A.40, subdivision 3;
169A.41, subdivision 2; 169A.54, subdivision 6; 169A.60, subdivisions 1, 13, 14; 169A.63,
subdivision 1; 171.07, subdivision 1; 171.09; 171.183, subdivision 1; 171.29, subdivision 2;
171.39; 174.24, subdivision 3b; 174.35; 174.55, subdivisions 4, 5; 174.70, subdivisions 2, 3;
174.88, subdivision 2; 222.63, subdivision 4; 243.166, subdivisions 1, 3, 4a, 6; 243.167,
subdivision 1; 299A.64, subdivision 1; 299C.10, subdivision 1; 299C.11; 299C.65, subdivisions 1,
2; 343.20, by adding subdivisions; 343.21, subdivisions 9, 10, by adding a subdivision; 343.235,
subdivisions 1, 3; 347.50, subdivision 1, by adding a subdivision; 347.51, subdivisions 2, 9, by
adding a subdivision; 347.52; 347.55; 357.021, subdivisions 6, 7; 446A.085; 473.399, by adding a
subdivision; 609.035, subdivision 2; 609.117; 609.487, subdivision 4; 609.495, subdivisions 1, 3;
609.521; 617.247, subdivision 3, as amended; 626.52, by adding a subdivision; 629.471,
subdivision 2; Laws 1997, chapter 159, article 2, section 4; Laws 1999, chapter 238, article 1,
section 2, subdivision 7; Laws 2001, chapter 161, section 58; proposing coding for new law in
Minnesota Statutes, chapters 161; 167; 168A; 169A; 174; 219; 299A; 299C; 347; 609; 626;
repealing Minnesota Statutes 2000, sections 174.22, subdivision 9; 243.166, subdivision 10;
347.51, subdivision 6; 626.55, subdivision 2.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 7 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

Senator Samuelson introduced--

S.F. No. 8: A bill for an act proposing an amendment to the Minnesota Constitution, article IV,
section 12; authorizing the legislature to call special sessions.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 8 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

Senator Cohen introduced--

S.F. No. 9: A bill for an act relating to state government; appropriating money for the general
legislative and administrative expenses of state government; modifying provisions relating to state
government operations.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 9 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

Senators Price, Krentz, Higgins and Frederickson introduced--

S.F. No. 10: A bill for an act relating to state government; appropriating money for
environmental, natural resources, and agricultural purposes; establishing and modifying certain
programs; providing for regulation of certain activities and practices; providing for accounts,
assessments, and fees; amending Minnesota Statutes 2000, sections 13.6435, subdivision 8;
17.039; 17.101, subdivision 5; 17.102, subdivision 3; 17.1025; 17.109, subdivision 3; 17.115;
17.116; 17.117; 17.457, subdivision 10; 17.53, subdivisions 2, 8, 13; 17.63; 17.85; 17A.03,
subdivision 7; 17B.15, subdivision 1; 18B.01, by adding a subdivision; 18B.065, subdivision 5;
18E.04, subdivisions 2, 4, 5; 21.85, subdivision 12; 27.041, subdivision 2; 28A.04, subdivision 1;
28A.075; 28A.0752, subdivision 1; 28A.085, subdivision 4; 29.22, subdivision 2; 29.23,
subdivisions 2, 3, 4; 29.237; 31.101, by adding a subdivision; 31.39; 31A.21, subdivision 2; 32.21,
subdivision 4; 32.392; 32.394, subdivisions 4, 8a, 8e; 32.415; 32.475, subdivision 2; 32.70,
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subdivisions 7, 8; 34.07; 41B.025, subdivision 1; 41B.03, subdivision 2; 41B.043, subdivisions 1b,
2; 41B.046, subdivision 2; 84.0887, subdivisions 1, 2, 4, 5, 6, 9; 84.83, subdivision 3, as amended;
84.925, subdivision 1; 84.9256, subdivision 1; 84.928, subdivision 2; 85.015, by adding
subdivisions; 85.052, subdivision 4; 85.055, subdivision 2; 85.32, subdivision 1; 86A.21; 86B.106;
88.641, subdivision 2, by adding subdivisions; 88.642; 88.645; 88.647; 88.648; 88.75, subdivision
1; 89A.06, subdivision 2a; 93.002, subdivision 1; 97A.045, subdivision 7; 97A.055, by adding a
subdivision; 97A.405, subdivision 2; 97A.411, subdivision 2; 97A.473, subdivisions 2, 3, 5;
97A.474, subdivisions 2, 3; 97A.475, subdivisions 5, 6, 10; 97A.485, subdivision 6; 97B.001,
subdivision 1; 97B.721; 97C.305; 115.03, by adding a subdivision; 115.55, subdivision 3;
115A.0716, by adding a subdivision; 115A.54, subdivision 2a; 115A.557, subdivision 2;
115A.912, subdivision 1; 115A.914, subdivision 2; 115B.49, subdivision 4a; 115C.07, subdivision
3; 115C.09, subdivisions 1, 2a, 3, 3h; 115C.093; 115C.112; 115C.13; 116.07, subdivision 2;
116.70, subdivision 1; 116O.09, subdivision 1a; 223.17, subdivision 3; 231.16; 256J.20,
subdivision 3; 296A.01, subdivision 19; 297A.94; 473.845, subdivision 3; 609.687, subdivision 4;
Laws 1986, chapter 398, article 1, section 18, as amended; Laws 1995, chapter 220, section 142,
as amended; Laws 1996, chapter 407, section 32, subdivision 4; Laws 1999, chapter 231, section
16, subdivision 4; Laws 2000, chapter 473, section 21; proposing coding for new law in Minnesota
Statutes, chapters 18B; 28A; 32; 84; 88; 115A; 116P; 626; repealing Minnesota Statutes 2000,
sections 13.6435, subdivision 7; 17.042; 17.06; 17.07; 17.108; 17.139; 17.45; 17.76; 17.987;
17A.091, subdivision 1; 17B.21; 17B.23; 17B.24; 17B.25; 17B.26; 17B.27; 18.205; 24.001;
24.002; 24.12; 24.131; 24.135; 24.141; 24.145; 24.151; 24.155; 24.161; 24.171; 24.175; 24.18;
24.181; 25.47; 27.185; 29.025; 29.049; 30.50; 30.51; 31.11, subdivision 2; 31.185; 31.73; 31B.07;
32.11; 32.12; 32.18; 32.19; 32.20; 32.203; 32.204; 32.206; 32.208; 32.471, subdivision 1; 32.474;
32.481, subdivision 2; 32.529; 32.53; 32.531, subdivisions 1, 5, 6, 7; 32.5311; 32.5312; 32.532;
32.533; 32.534; 32.55, subdivisions 15, 16, 17; 33.001; 33.002; 33.01; 33.011; 33.02; 33.03;
33.031; 33.032; 33.06; 33.07; 33.08; 33.09; 33.091; 33.111; 35.04; 35.14; 35.84; 86.71; 86.72;
88.641, subdivisions 4, 5; 88.644; 115.55, subdivision 8; 115A.906; 115A.912, subdivisions 2, 3;
115C.02, subdivisions 11a, 12a; 115C.082; 115C.09, subdivision 3g; 115C.091; 115C.092;
116.67; 116.70, subdivisions 2, 3a, 4; 116.71; 116.72; 116.73; 116.74; Minnesota Rules, parts
1560.9000, subpart 2; 7023.9000; 7023.9005; 7023.9010; 7023.9015; 7023.9020; 7023.9025;
7023.9030; 7023.9035; 7023.9040; 7023.9045; 7023.9050; 7080.0020, subparts 24c, 51a;
7080.0400; 7080.0450.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 10 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

Senators Wiener, Kierlin, Murphy, Larson and Scheid introduced--

S.F. No. 11: A bill for an act relating to education; appropriating money for education and
related purposes to the higher education services office, board of trustees of the Minnesota state
colleges and universities, board of regents of the University of Minnesota, and the Mayo Medical
Foundation, with certain conditions; establishing an account in the state enterprise fund;
authorizing appropriations from the medical education endowment fund; modifying state
appropriations for certain enrollments; extending expiration deadline for certain advisory groups;
adjusting assigned family responsibility; modifying grant provisions; establishing a grant program;
authorizing acquisition of certain facilities by the board of trustees; providing for refund of tuition
for certain students; making various clarifying and technical changes; deleting obsolete references;
establishing a developmental education demonstration project; establishing a commission on
University of Minnesota excellence; requiring reports; amending Minnesota Statutes 2000,
sections 13.322, subdivision 3; 16A.87; 62J.694, subdivisions 1, 2, by adding a subdivision;
135A.031, subdivision 2; 136A.031, by adding a subdivision; 136A.101, subdivisions 5a, 8;
136A.121, subdivisions 6, 9; 136A.125, subdivisions 2, 4; 136A.241; 136A.242; 136A.243,
subdivisions 1, 2, 3, 4, 9, by adding a subdivision; 136A.244, subdivisions 1, 4; 136A.245,
subdivisions 2, 4, by adding subdivisions; 136F.13, subdivision 1; 136F.60, subdivision 2; 137.10;
169.966; 299A.45, subdivisions 1, 4; 354.094, subdivision 2; 354.69; 356.24, subdivision 1; Laws
1986, chapter 398, article 1, section 18, as amended; proposing coding for new law in Minnesota
Statutes, chapters 16A; 136A; 136F; repealing Minnesota Statutes 2000, sections 135A.06,
subdivision 1; 136F.13, subdivision 2; Laws 1994, chapter 643, section 66.
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Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 11 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

Senators Anderson; Johnson, Dave; Orfield and Cohen introduced--

S.F. No. 12: A bill for an act relating to state government; appropriating money for economic
development, housing, and certain agencies of state government; establishing and modifying
programs; transferring certain duties and funds; regulating activities and practices; modifying fees;
making conforming changes.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 12 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

Senator Pogemiller introduced--

S.F. No. 13: A bill for an act relating to the financing and operation of government in this state;
making changes to income, sales and use, property, motor vehicle sales, motor vehicle registration,
mortgage registry, deed, insurance premiums, motor fuels, cigarette and tobacco, liquor, lawful
gambling, and special taxes; changing and allowing tax credits and exemptions; conforming with
changes in federal income tax provisions; providing for allocation of income; changing property
tax valuation, assessment, levy, classification, homestead, exemption, review, appeal, and
distribution provisions; changing certain provisions relating to biomass facilities; providing for
uniform sales and use tax administration; providing for taxation and incentive payments on forest
lands; providing for electronic filing and payment of taxes; changing procedures for disposition of
seized contraband; changing tax increment financing provisions; providing for payments in lieu of
taxes; changing calculation of rent constituting property taxes for purposes of property tax
refunds; providing special authority to certain political subdivisions; authorizing special taxing
districts; changing and clarifying tax administration, collection, enforcement, interest, and penalty
provisions; transferring administration and enforcement of the Unfair Cigarette Sales Act from the
commissioner of revenue to the commissioner of commerce; changing revenue recapture
provisions; authorizing abatements and waivers of fees and certain taxes in disaster areas;
changing and imposing a fee; changing debt collection provisions for student loans; providing
certain duties and powers to the commissioner of revenue; authorizing publication of names of
certain delinquent taxpayers; authorizing border city allocations; changing provisions relating to
tax-forfeited lands and providing for tax-forfeited lands transfers; defining a lottery and other
terms; classifying data; requiring a report; imposing penalties; appropriating money; amending
Minnesota Statutes 2000, sections 16A.152, subdivision 2; 16D.08, subdivision 2; 45.011,
subdivision 1; 69.021, subdivision 5, as amended; 84.922, by adding a subdivision; 88.49,
subdivisions 5, 9a; 88.491, subdivision 2; 103D.905, subdivision 3; 115B.24, subdivision 2;
123A.45, subdivisions 2, 6; 144.3831, subdivision 2; 168.013, subdivision 1a; 168.017,
subdivision 3; 216B.2424, subdivision 5; 239.101, subdivision 3; 270.06; 270.07, subdivision 3,
by adding a subdivision; 270.271, subdivisions 1, 3; 270.60, by adding a subdivision; 270.70,
subdivision 13; 270.73, subdivision 1; 270.771; 270.78; 270A.03, subdivisions 5, 7; 270A.11;
270B.02, subdivisions 2, 3; 270B.03, subdivision 6; 271.01, subdivision 5; 271.21, subdivision 2;
272.02, subdivisions 10, 22, by adding a subdivision; 273.061, subdivisions 1, 2; 273.072,
subdivision 1; 273.11, subdivisions 1a, 14, by adding subdivisions; 273.1104, subdivision 2;
273.111, subdivision 4; 273.121; 273.124, subdivisions 1, 8, 13, 14; 274.01, subdivision 1; 274.13,
subdivision 1; 275.065, subdivisions 3, 5a, 6; 275.066; 275.07, subdivision 1; 275.62, subdivision
1; 276A.01, subdivision 3; 281.17; 282.01, subdivisions 1, 1b, 1c, 1d, 1e; 282.04, subdivision 2;
282.241; 287.08; 287.12; 287.20, subdivisions 2, 9; 287.21, subdivision 1; 287.28; 289A.02,
subdivision 7, by adding a subdivision; 289A.12, subdivision 3; 289A.18, subdivision 4, as
amended; 289A.20, subdivisions 1, 2, 4; 289A.26, subdivision 2a; 289A.31, subdivision 7;
289A.50, subdivisions 2, 2a; 289A.55, subdivision 9; 289A.60, subdivisions 1, 2, 7, 21, as
amended, by adding a subdivision; 290.01, subdivisions 6b, 19, 19c, 19d, 31; 290.06, subdivisions
2c, 23; 290.067, subdivisions 2, 2b; 290.0671, subdivisions 1, 7; 290.0675, subdivisions 1, 3;
290.0921, subdivision 3; 290.92, subdivision 23; 290A.03, subdivisions 12, 15; 290A.15; 291.005,
subdivision 1; 295.55, subdivision 4; 296A.07, subdivision 4; 296A.08, subdivision 3; 296A.15,
subdivisions 1, 7; 296A.16, subdivision 2; 296A.21, subdivisions 1, 4; 296A.24, subdivisions 1, 2;
297A.01, subdivision 5; 297A.07, subdivision 3; 297A.25, subdivisions 3, 11, 28; 297A.61,
subdivisions 2, 3, 4, 6, 7, 9, 10, 14, 17, 19, 22, 23, by adding subdivisions; 297A.64, subdivisions
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3, 4; 297A.66, subdivisions 1, 3; 297A.67, subdivisions 2, 8, 23, 24, 25, by adding subdivisions;
297A.68, subdivisions 2, 3, 5, 11, 13, 14, 18, 19, 25; 297A.69, subdivision 2; 297A.70,
subdivisions 1, 2, 3, 4, 7, 8, 13, 14; 297A.71, subdivision 6; 297A.72, subdivision 1; 297A.75;
297A.77, subdivision 1; 297A.80; 297A.82, subdivision 3, by adding a subdivision; 297A.86,
subdivision 1; 297A.89, subdivision 1; 297A.90, subdivision 1; 297A.91; 297A.92, subdivision 2;
297A.94, as amended; 297A.99, subdivisions 7, 9, 11; 297B.03; 297E.02, subdivision 4; 297E.16,
subdivisions 1, 2; 297F.04, subdivision 1; 297F.09, subdivision 7; 297F.13, subdivision 4;
297F.16, subdivision 4; 297F.20, subdivision 3; 297F.21, subdivisions 1, 2, 3; 297G.09,
subdivision 6; 297G.15, subdivision 4; 297G.16, subdivisions 5, 7; 297G.20, subdivisions 3, 4;
297H.04, by adding a subdivision; 297H.06, by adding a subdivision; 297I.35, subdivision 2;
297I.85, subdivision 7; 325D.33, subdivision 8, by adding a subdivision; 325D.405; 325D.415;
345.41; 349.19, subdivision 2a; 461.12, by adding a subdivision; 469.040, subdivision 5; 469.169,
by adding a subdivision; 469.174, subdivisions 3, 10, 10a, 12; 469.175, subdivisions 1, 6b, by
adding a subdivision; 469.176, subdivisions 1b, 1e, 3, 4g, by adding a subdivision; 469.177,
subdivision 1; 469.178, by adding a subdivision; 469.1812, subdivision 2; 469.1813, subdivision
6; 469.202, subdivision 2; 473.843, subdivision 3; 473H.10, subdivision 3; 475.58, subdivision 1,
as amended; 477A.12; 477A.14; 609.75, subdivision 1; Laws 1986, chapter 396, section 5; Laws
1992, chapter 499, article 7, section 31, as amended; Laws 2000, chapter 490, article 11, section
26; proposing coding for new law in Minnesota Statutes, chapters 12; 103B; 126C; 144F; 270;
272; 290C; 295; 296A; 297A; 297F; 297H; 383A; 471; repealing Minnesota Statutes 2000,
sections 16A.1521; 126C.30; 126C.31; 126C.32; 126C.33; 126C.34; 126C.35; 126C.36; 270.31;
270.32; 270.33; 270.34; 270.35; 270.36; 270.37; 270.38; 270.39; 275.078; 289A.60, subdivision 3;
290.06, subdivision 25; 290.095, subdivision 7; 290.23; 290.25; 290.31, subdivisions 2, 2a, 3, 4, 5,
19; 290A.04, subdivision 2j; 296A.16, subdivision 6; 296A.24, subdivision 3; 297A.61,
subdivision 16; 297A.62, subdivision 2; 297A.64, subdivision 1; 297A.68, subdivision 21;
297A.71, subdivisions 2, 15, 16; 297B.032; 297E.16, subdivision 3; 297F.21, subdivision 4;
297G.20, subdivision 5; 297I.05, subdivision 8; 297I.30, subdivision 3; 325D.33, subdivision 5;
Laws 1988, chapter 426, section 1; Laws 1988, chapter 702, section 16; Laws 1992, chapter 511,
article 2, section 52, as amended; Laws 1996, chapter 471, article 8, section 45; Laws 1999,
chapter 243, article 6, section 14; Laws 1999, chapter 243, article 6, section 15; Laws 2000,
chapter 490, article 6, section 17; Minnesota Rules, parts 8120.0200; 8120.0500; 8120.0700;
8120.0900; 8120.1300; 8120.1600; 8120.2000; 8120.2100; 8120.2200; 8120.2300; 8120.2500;
8120.2700; 8120.2800; 8120.3000; 8120.3200; 8120.4300; 8120.4400; 8120.4500; 8120.4600;
8120.4900; 8120.5000; 8120.5100; 8120.5300.

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that S.F. No. 13 be laid on the table. The motion prevailed.

MEMBERS EXCUSED

Senators Kiscaden and Stumpf were excused from the Session of today from 8:00 to 8:30 a.m.
Senators Dille and Rest were excused from the Session of today from 8:00 to 8:40 a.m.

ADJOURNMENT

Senator Moe, R.D. moved that the Senate do now adjourn until 10:30 a.m., Thursday, June 14,
2001. The motion prevailed.

Patrick E. Flahaven, Secretary of the Senate
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